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Coming Soon: Jiffy Lube Expands To Service Additional Neighborhoods

State-of-the-art Multicare centers have recently opened in St. Cloud and Largo, bringing the
total number of Jiffy Lube stores to well over 100 in southwest, central, and northeast Florida.

LARGO, Fla. (PRWEB) August 02, 2019 -- While car ownership is a necessity for many, it brings with it the
headache of finding a reliable source to carry out necessary vehicle maintenance. And that, in an industry
historically rife with some distinctly roguish characters, can be somewhat of a challenge. The news that the
trusted name of Jiffy Lube is expanding its network of franchises to include their well-received Multicare stores
brings a trusted brand within easy reach for many more potential customers.

Over 20 million car owners benefit from local Jiffy Lube locations throughout the US. Until now, residents of
Florida have not been quite as well off for such a service as other parts of the country. But this is set to change
with the opening of two new service centers in the state, and the promise of more to come. State-of-the-art
Multicare centers have recently opened in St. Cloud and Largo, bringing the total number of Jiffy Lube stores to
well over 100 in southwest, central, and northeast Florida.

Far More Than Just An Oil Change Service

The trusted brand of Jiffy Lube is, for many, most commonly associated with the drive-thru oil change—it was
they who revolutionized the industry when they introduced the concept back in 1979. Today they continue to
lead the way and are evolving a new brand model known as Jiffy Lube Multicare. From tasks such as tire
rotation and tire changes, battery maintenance and repair, brake services, wheel alignments, air conditioning
servicing, air filter inspections and replacement, fuel system cleaning, transmission services, suspension work
and much more, when it comes to car care and preventative maintenance then Jiffy Lube locations in Florida
and beyond provide a one-stop-shop for everything necessary to keep a car in tip-top condition.

Personal Service Through A Trusted Brand Name

Thanks to the continuing growth of this new expanded business model, and the great reception from a fast-
growing customer base, finding a garage with technicians that are trustworthy just became a much easier task.
The aforementioned new locations are situated at 860 E. Irlo Bronson Memorial Highway, St Cloud and 9420
Ulmerton Road, Largo, with the latter in particular being a prime location for the fourth largest city in the
Tampa Bay region. Customers visiting any Jiffy Lube for oil changes, brake and tire services, and engine
diagnostics will fully benefit from expert advice, clearly communicated prices, and the guarantee and peace of
mind afforded by working with a household name.

Such is the draw of the brand of Jiffy Lube that Jason Thomas and Leif Oskarsson, co-owners of South Bay
Lube, have run franchises throughout Florida for the past 25 years. They currently operate 32 Jiffy Lube service
centers, covering much of the central, northeast, and southwest of the region. Thomas says of the continued
development, "I'm excited about our growth over the past several years. We are always looking for
opportunities to grow our footprint to better serve consumers in the community.”

All Jiffy Lube stores operate a strict policy of only using experienced, qualified technicians, and customers are
guaranteed of professional advice and quality, industry-leading service and maintenance, and all the reliability
one expects from such a trusted national brand. As they continue to expand even more car owners will be able
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to take advantage of all the services on offer, and thanks to increased Jiffy Lube locations it will soon be
possible for most people to have a convenient store within easy distance of home or work. In Tampa Bay,
Florida and beyond, it’s now possible to depend on the trusted name of Jiffy Lube for virtually all car
maintenance and servicing needs. For more information please visit https://jiffylubetampabay.com/.
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Contact Information
Jiffy Lube
Jiffy Lube
http://https://jiffylubetampabay.com/
(941) 953-9181

Online Web 2.0 Version
You can read the online version of this press release here.
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